
Larnique Mickens
Director
Heritage Mortuary

Larnique Mickens takes great pride in her role
as a mother to her children, Asia and Skylor.
She comes from a long line of military
volunteers, being a third-generation member
herself and having served in the USAF for 24
years before retiring. Larnique is also a
trailblazer as a first-generation funeral director,
notary, Black Belt Six Sigma Business
Consultant, and First Lady. Her dedication to
her community is evident through her lifetime
membership in the Air Force Sergeants
Association (AFSA), with Chapter 1252 Nellis
AFB being her cherished home Chapter. 

Originally hailing from West Palm Beach,
Florida, Larnique draws inspiration from her
mother and grandmother, who served as
influential role models in her life. They
imparted upon her invaluable guidance,
wisdom, insight, and a strong set of values. It
was through their teachings that Larnique
developed a deep-rooted passion for serving
others. Despite humble beginnings, she
achieved success through sheer hard work,
unwavering commitment, and unyielding drive.
Larnique is also a compassionate and
dedicated servant leader, and she has been
happily married for 22 years. 

At Heritage, Larnique can be found leading her
team with the utmost dedication, arranging
meaningful ceremonies for families, and
educating them on the importance of
celebrating their loved ones and fostering
connections with families and friends. 


